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The first book to use the unexpected discoveries of neuroscience to help us make the best decisions

Since Plato, philosophers have described the decision-making process as either rational or emotional: we
carefully deliberate, or we “blink” and go with our gut. But as scientists break open the mind’s black box
with the latest tools of neuroscience, they’re discovering that this is not how the mind works. Our best
decisions are a finely tuned blend of both feeling and reasonâ€”and the precise mix depends on the situation.
When buying a house, for example, it’s best to let our unconscious mull over the many variables. But when
we’re picking a stock, intuition often leads us astray. The trick is to determine when to use the different parts
of the brain, and to do this, we need to think harder (and smarter) about how we think.

Jonah Lehrer arms us with the tools we need, drawing on cutting-edge research as well as the real-world
experiences of a wide range of “deciders”â€”from airplane pilots and hedge fund investors to serial killers
and poker players.

Lehrer shows how people are taking advantage of the new science to make better television shows, win more
football games, and improve military intelligence. His goal is to answer two questions that are of interest to
just about anyone, from CEOs to firefighters: How does the human mind make decisions? And how can we
make those decisions better?
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From reader reviews:

George Seal:

Playing with family in the park, coming to see the marine world or hanging out with good friends is thing
that usually you could have done when you have spare time, then why you don't try issue that really opposite
from that. A single activity that make you not experiencing tired but still relaxing, trilling like on roller
coaster you have been ride on and with addition of knowledge. Even you love How We Decide, you could
enjoy both. It is great combination right, you still want to miss it? What kind of hang type is it? Oh occur its
mind hangout guys. What? Still don't get it, oh come on its known as reading friends.

David Lau:

Many people spending their time by playing outside together with friends, fun activity using family or just
watching TV all day every day. You can have new activity to spend your whole day by examining a book.
Ugh, do you consider reading a book can really hard because you have to bring the book everywhere? It all
right you can have the e-book, taking everywhere you want in your Mobile phone. Like How We Decide
which is getting the e-book version. So , try out this book? Let's notice.

Tyron Lenahan:

Do you like reading a guide? Confuse to looking for your selected book? Or your book seemed to be rare?
Why so many question for the book? But almost any people feel that they enjoy intended for reading. Some
people likes looking at, not only science book and also novel and How We Decide or others sources were
given information for you. After you know how the truly amazing a book, you feel desire to read more and
more. Science guide was created for teacher or perhaps students especially. Those books are helping them to
add their knowledge. In some other case, beside science reserve, any other book likes How We Decide to
make your spare time a lot more colorful. Many types of book like here.

Kenneth Jordan:

What is your hobby? Have you heard which question when you got pupils? We believe that that problem was
given by teacher to the students. Many kinds of hobby, Everyone has different hobby. And you know that
little person including reading or as reading through become their hobby. You need to understand that
reading is very important as well as book as to be the thing. Book is important thing to increase you
knowledge, except your personal teacher or lecturer. You see good news or update in relation to something
by book. Amount types of books that can you choose to adopt be your object. One of them is niagra How We
Decide.
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