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“Refreshing, inspiring, and honest….One book I’m not going to be ‘giving up’ anytime soon.”
—Nicole Williams, author of Earn What You’re Worth

Give It Up! is author Mary Carlomagno’s inspiring chronicle of her 365 days spent learning to live better
with less—when she decided to give up one modern convenience (eg: elevators) or indulgence (eg: alcohol)
every month for a year. A joyous celebration of voluntary simplicity, Give It Up! offers a solution and a
liberating new outlook to shopaholics, jaded consumers, and spirituality seekers overwhelmed by the
unnecessary clutter in their lives, in the most uplifting self-help guide to better living since Gretchen Rubin’s
The Happiness Project.
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From reader reviews:

Heather Jones:

This Give It Up! tend to be reliable for you who want to certainly be a successful person, why. The reason of
this Give It Up! can be on the list of great books you must have is actually giving you more than just simple
studying food but feed a person with information that maybe will shock your earlier knowledge. This book is
actually handy, you can bring it everywhere and whenever your conditions both in e-book and printed types.
Beside that this Give It Up! giving you an enormous of experience for example rich vocabulary, giving you
trial run of critical thinking that could it useful in your day pastime. So , let's have it appreciate reading.

Fay Harris:

People live in this new morning of lifestyle always make an effort to and must have the extra time or they
will get great deal of stress from both day to day life and work. So , whenever we ask do people have spare
time, we will say absolutely sure. People is human not only a robot. Then we ask again, what kind of activity
have you got when the spare time coming to an individual of course your answer may unlimited right. Then
ever try this one, reading ebooks. It can be your alternative inside spending your spare time, the actual book
you have read is Give It Up!.

Molly Salazar:

The book untitled Give It Up! contain a lot of information on that. The writer explains her idea with easy
method. The language is very easy to understand all the people, so do definitely not worry, you can easy to
read the item. The book was written by famous author. The author brings you in the new period of time of
literary works. It is possible to read this book because you can read on your smart phone, or program, so you
can read the book in anywhere and anytime. In a situation you wish to purchase the e-book, you can wide
open their official web-site and also order it. Have a nice go through.

Carol Ton:

Many people spending their time period by playing outside along with friends, fun activity using family or
just watching TV the entire day. You can have new activity to shell out your whole day by studying a book.
Ugh, you think reading a book really can hard because you have to use the book everywhere? It fine you can
have the e-book, having everywhere you want in your Mobile phone. Like Give It Up! which is having the e-
book version. So , try out this book? Let's observe.
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