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Beloved for contemporary romance novels that "deliver laughter, tears, and so much joy," (RT Book
Reviews), JoAnn Ross expands her wildly popular New York Times bestselling Shelter Bay series to
southern Oregon ranching country, home to three sexy Murphy brothers and the strong, passionate women
who fall in love them.

Welcome to River's Bend — Oregon's most western town where spurs have a job to do and cowboy hats
aren’t a fashion accessory.

Rachel Hathaway was living a fairy tale when she learned the hard way that fairy tales never warn you that
the prince could die of a perforated ulcer, the creditors could end up with the castle, and it could be back to
the ashes for Cinderella. With her storybook marriage shattered, Rachel vows to never, ever, risk her heart
again.

No stranger to personal tragedy, Sheriff Cooper Murphy knows about starting over. When Rachel arrives in
River's Bend to begin a new life with her young son, he realizes that the love-shy single mother is just the
woman he's been waiting for. Although he wants to throw her over his shoulder and carry her off into the
western sunset, Cooper knows that he'll have to be patient, move slow, if he wants to convince Rachel to
believe in their own Happily Ever After.

Revised, expanded "author's edition" of Murphy's Law.
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From reader reviews:

Kurt Gomez:

Book is written, printed, or descriptive for everything. You can know everything you want by a publication.
Book has a different type. We all know that that book is important thing to bring us around the world. Next
to that you can your reading proficiency was fluently. A guide River's Bend will make you to possibly be
smarter. You can feel far more confidence if you can know about everything. But some of you think this
open or reading some sort of book make you bored. It is not necessarily make you fun. Why they can be
thought like that? Have you trying to find best book or ideal book with you?

Inocencia Hensley:

River's Bend can be one of your beginning books that are good idea. We recommend that straight away
because this guide has good vocabulary that will increase your knowledge in words, easy to understand, bit
entertaining but nevertheless delivering the information. The copy writer giving his/her effort that will put
every word into satisfaction arrangement in writing River's Bend however doesn't forget the main position,
giving the reader the hottest and also based confirm resource facts that maybe you can be certainly one of it.
This great information can certainly drawn you into brand-new stage of crucial imagining.

Rhonda Silva:

Reading a book to be new life style in this calendar year; every people loves to read a book. When you learn
a book you can get a large amount of benefit. When you read publications, you can improve your knowledge,
simply because book has a lot of information into it. The information that you will get depend on what forms
of book that you have read. If you need to get information about your review, you can read education books,
but if you want to entertain yourself look for a fiction books, these kinds of us novel, comics, as well as soon.
The River's Bend will give you new experience in reading through a book.

Cheri Adamo:

You will get this River's Bend by go to the bookstore or Mall. Simply viewing or reviewing it might to be
your solve issue if you get difficulties to your knowledge. Kinds of this guide are various. Not only simply
by written or printed but can you enjoy this book simply by e-book. In the modern era such as now, you just
looking because of your mobile phone and searching what their problem. Right now, choose your own
personal ways to get more information about your publication. It is most important to arrange you to
ultimately make your knowledge are still change. Let's try to choose suitable ways for you.
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