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In early modern medical texts, intense unfulfilled erotic desire is held to be a real and virulent disease: it is
classified as a species of melancholy, with physical etiologies and cures. Lesel Dawson analyzes literary
representations of lovesickness in relation to medical ideas about desire and wider questions about gender
and identity, exploring the different ways that desire is believed to take root in the body, how gender roles
are encoded and contested in courtship, and the psychic pains and pleasures of frustrated passion. She
explores the relationship between women's lovesickness and other female maladies (such as hysteria and
greensickness), and asks whether women can suffer from intellectual forms of melancholy generally thought
to be exclusively male. Finally, she examines the ways in which Neoplatonism offers an alternative
construction of love to that found in natural philosophy and considers how anxieties concerning love's ability
to emasculate the male lover emerge indirectly in remedies for lovesickness.

With reference to the works of Shakespeare, Beaumont and Fletcher, Middleton, Ford, and Davenant,
Lovesickness and Gender in Early Modern English Literature investigates how early modern representations
of lovesickness expose contemporary cultural constructions of love, revealing the relation of sexuality to
spirituality and the creation and shattering of the impassioned subject. It offers an important contribution to
the history of romantic love and will be of interest to students and scholars of literature, gender, and medical
history.
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From reader reviews:

David Lucero:

Do you considered one of people who can't read gratifying if the sentence chained in the straightway, hold
on guys this specific aren't like that. This Lovesickness and Gender in Early Modern English Literature book
is readable through you who hate those straight word style. You will find the info here are arrange for
enjoyable examining experience without leaving actually decrease the knowledge that want to provide to
you. The writer involving Lovesickness and Gender in Early Modern English Literature content conveys the
idea easily to understand by a lot of people. The printed and e-book are not different in the written content
but it just different in the form of it. So , do you nevertheless thinking Lovesickness and Gender in Early
Modern English Literature is not loveable to be your top listing reading book?

Melanie Finnegan:

Reading a book can be one of a lot of pastime that everyone in the world adores. Do you like reading book
so. There are a lot of reasons why people fantastic. First reading a book will give you a lot of new data.
When you read a publication you will get new information simply because book is one of numerous ways to
share the information or their idea. Second, examining a book will make you actually more imaginative.
When you studying a book especially fiction book the author will bring one to imagine the story how the
personas do it anything. Third, you could share your knowledge to other individuals. When you read this
Lovesickness and Gender in Early Modern English Literature, it is possible to tells your family, friends and
soon about yours reserve. Your knowledge can inspire different ones, make them reading a publication.

Belen Riedel:

This Lovesickness and Gender in Early Modern English Literature is brand-new way for you who has
fascination to look for some information because it relief your hunger of information. Getting deeper you
into it getting knowledge more you know or you who still having little bit of digest in reading this
Lovesickness and Gender in Early Modern English Literature can be the light food for you personally
because the information inside this kind of book is easy to get through anyone. These books build itself in
the form which can be reachable by anyone, yes I mean in the e-book application form. People who think
that in guide form make them feel tired even dizzy this guide is the answer. So there isn't any in reading a
publication especially this one. You can find what you are looking for. It should be here for you actually. So
, don't miss that! Just read this e-book sort for your better life along with knowledge.

Patricia Dennis:

What is your hobby? Have you heard this question when you got college students? We believe that that
problem was given by teacher for their students. Many kinds of hobby, Every individual has different hobby.
And you also know that little person like reading or as reading become their hobby. You should know that
reading is very important and also book as to be the factor. Book is important thing to provide you



knowledge, except your own personal teacher or lecturer. You discover good news or update concerning
something by book. A substantial number of sorts of books that can you decide to try be your object. One of
them is niagra Lovesickness and Gender in Early Modern English Literature.
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