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Laurence Gonzales's electrifying adventure opens in the jungles of the Congo. Jenny Lowe, a primatologist
studying chimpanzees-the bonobos-is running for her life. A civil war has exploded and Jenny is trapped in
its crosshairs.

She runs to the camp of a fellow primatologist, but the rebels have already been there. Everyone is dead
except a young girl, the daughter of Jenny's brutally murdered fellow scientist-and competitor.

Jenny and the child flee, Jenny grabbing the notebooks of the primatologist who's been killed. She brings the
girl to Chicago to await the discovery of her relatives. The girl is 15 and lovely-her name is Lucy.

Realizing that the child has no living relatives, Jenny begins to care for her as her own. When she reads the
notebooks written by Lucy's father, she discovers that the adorable, lovely, magical Lucy is the result of an
experiment: she is part human, part ape-a hybrid human being.

Laurence Gonzales's novel grabs you from its opening pages and you stay with it, mesmerized by the shy but
fierce, wonderfully winning Lucy.
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From reader reviews:

Jeremy Scott:

Within other case, little individuals like to read book Lucy. You can choose the best book if you'd prefer
reading a book. So long as we know about how is important any book Lucy. You can add know-how and of
course you can around the world with a book. Absolutely right, simply because from book you can learn
everything! From your country until foreign or abroad you will end up known. About simple issue until
wonderful thing you are able to know that. In this era, we are able to open a book or maybe searching by
internet gadget. It is called e-book. You may use it when you feel bored stiff to go to the library. Let's read.

Jacqueline Campbell:

In this 21st century, people become competitive in each way. By being competitive right now, people have
do something to make these individuals survives, being in the middle of typically the crowded place and
notice through surrounding. One thing that at times many people have underestimated that for a while is
reading. Yep, by reading a guide your ability to survive raise then having chance to remain than other is
high. In your case who want to start reading the book, we give you this particular Lucy book as beginning
and daily reading guide. Why, because this book is more than just a book.

Lewis Dall:

As people who live in the modest era should be up-date about what going on or details even knowledge to
make these individuals keep up with the era that is always change and progress. Some of you maybe will
update themselves by reading books. It is a good choice to suit your needs but the problems coming to you
actually is you don't know what kind you should start with. This Lucy is our recommendation to cause you to
keep up with the world. Why, because book serves what you want and need in this era.

Shannon Silva:

A lot of e-book has printed but it differs from the others. You can get it by internet on social media. You can
choose the very best book for you, science, comedy, novel, or whatever by means of searching from it. It is
referred to as of book Lucy. You'll be able to your knowledge by it. Without causing the printed book, it
might add your knowledge and make you happier to read. It is most essential that, you must aware about
publication. It can bring you from one destination for a other place.
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